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1. Purpose of this Paper 
 

To formalise the endorsement of the re-freshed Health and 
Wellbeing Strategy priorities and agree methods for holding 
to account on their delivery. 

 
2. Executive Summary 
 

In re-freshing the Strategy, the Health and Wellbeing Board 
decided that it needed to focus its efforts on the issues that it 
had the most direct influence over.  The HWB will work with 
other partnerships, such as the Children and Families 
Partnership Board and Safer Bristol Partnership  and other 
organisations to deliver on the issues on which they have the 
greatest influence.  Through this co-ordinated approach we 
believe that we will make progress, albeit in a challenging 
financial environment. 

 
3. Delivering the strategy 
 
3.1 Alcohol Misuse. 
 

There is a well developed Action Plan in progress for the 
delivery of this priority.  The working group is chaired by the 
Chair of the CCG. 

 
3.2 Mental Wellbeing and Social Isolation 
 



An “Open Space” Summit event is planned for Thursday 24th 
November, a.m. to scope the breadth of this priority. 

 
3.3 Healthy Weight 
 

It is proposed to hold an event in January 2017 to scope the 
work programme for this priority. 
 

4.0 Holding to account 
 

It is proposed that the lead for each priority co-ordinates a 
twice yearly performance report for the Health and Wellbeing 
Board. This will report against actions in the Action Plan. A 
few metrics will also need to be chosen for measuring 
success over the next 3 years. 

 
5. Key risks and Opportunities 
 

There is a risk that momentum for the delivery of these 
priorities will diminish over time.  The Health and Wellbeing 
Board will need to “hold to account” to ensure that 
momentum is not lost.  There is significant opportunities to 
add value, due to the inter-related nature of the priorities. 

 
6. Implications (Financial and Legal if appropriate) 
 
 Not for the purposes of this report. 
 
8. Recommendations 
 
8.1 It is recommended that 
 

• The priorities are endorsed. 
• A lead organisation is identified to lead on the development 

of action plans to deliver against these priorities. 
• Mechanisms for holding to account are agreed. (See 

paragraph 4 above). 
 
 
9. Appendices 
 
 Appendix A: Refreshed Health and Wellbeing Strategy 
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